

<p align="center">KPC OFFICE-CLASSROOM SUPPLIES (PV-OS-2017-01) BID CERTIFICATION</p>

Having read all the conditions and requirements of the request for bid and in compliance with all general and specific terms and conditions of the request for bid, in consideration of the detailed description attached hereto, and subject to the statements thereof, the undersigned agrees that, upon proper acceptance by KPC, of any part of the offer within the time stipulated, a contract shall thereby be created in accordance with the specifications for that part of the offer accepted.

You must return the following documents for your bid response to be considered complete:

1. This bid certification form completed and signed.
2. The bid pricing worksheet.
3. Resident Bidder affidavit (if applicable).

CERTIFICATION

Office Depot, Inc.

Bidding Firm


Authorizing Signature

6600 North Military Trail

Address

Claudia Hughes

Printed Name

Boca Raton, Florida 33496

City, State, Zip

keith.hughes@officedepot.com

Email Address

(561) 438-4800

Phone #

(800) 593-8830

Fax #

****Please Note - The Office Depot response includes the pricing and clarifications noted in the Letter of Clarifications document that accompanies this response.**

Bidding Firm:	OFFICE DEPOT
Prompt Payment Discount Percentage:	1.0%
Prompt Payment Discount Terms (Net Days):	1% EARLY PAY DISCOUNT FOR PAYMENT WITHIN 10 DAYS/NET 30
Do you currently have a website that supports a digital cmx1 punchout catalog?	partnerships using third party systems such as Ariba, SciQuest, and Oracle supplier network, and Direct Connection with various SAP, Oracle I, systems. These partnerships range from a simple Hosted catalog and cXML purchase order to a full XML solution including Direct catalog interface (Punchout/OCI/Roundtrip), Office Depot's standard delivery lead time is 21 hours for stocked items on orders received by
Orders placed before 5:00PM will be delivered:(e.g. next business day, 2nd business day, etc.)	Office Depot online by 5 PM. The delivery zones for Office Depot next business day delivery would apply to this delivery order time. Orders for delivery outside of the Office Depot next business day delivery zone would be shipped by UPS and delivered within 2 business days. Shipping charges for
Will all of your Kentucky retail outlets honor the line item pricing and secondary discounts submitted on this bid?	YES

AGENDAS/PLANNERS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	
AGENDA HAMMOND AND STEPHENS BLOCK.8 1/2X11 ELEM. OR EQUIV.	383			NO BID				
AGENDA HAMMOND AND STEPHENS BLOCK.7X11 OR EQUIVALENT	1022			NO BID				
AGENDA HAMMOND AND STEPHENS DAILY.7X11 OR EQUIVALENT	1210			NO BID				
CLASS RCD 9/10 WK 50 STUDENT 8 1/2X11	244	1	EA	365930	SP RICHARDS	HUB910L	\$ 2.99	
CLASS REC 9/10WK 35 STUDENT 8 1/2X11 BURGUNDY/WHITE	163	1	EA	365853	SP RICHARDS	HUB67L	\$ 3.21	
CLASS REC 9/10WK 8SUB 45 STUDENT 6 3/4X11 GREEN/RED	156	4	BD	196817	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	WAR910LBN	\$ 14.76	
CLASS REC 12/14WK 8SUB 40 STUDENT 8 1/2X11 GRREN/RED	172	4	BD	285060	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	WAR1214BN	\$ 14.44	
CLASS REC 6/7WK 8SUB 35 STUDENT 8.5X11 GREEN/RED	190	4	BD	966329	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	WAR67LBN	\$ 15.22	
CLASS REC 6/7WK 8SUB 35 STUDENT 9.25X12.25 GREEN/RED	282			NO BID				
CLASS REC 9/10WK 8SUB 40 STUDENT 8 1/2X11 GRREN/RED	1575	4	BD	733881	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	ELNR1010BN	\$ 16.06	
CLASS REC 9/10WK 8SUB 35 STUDENET 9.25X12.25 GREEN/RED	1625	4	BD	196817	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	WAR910LBN	\$ 14.76	
LESSON PLAN 6SUB 8 1/2 X 11	425	2	BD	103917	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	EU-866240BN	\$ 14.26	
LESSON PLAN 6SUB 9 1/4X12 1/4	799	1	EA	365839	SP RICHARDS	HUB16	\$ 3.13	
LESSON PLAN 8SUB 9 1/4X12 1/4	397	1	EA	365846	SP RICHARDS	HUB18	\$ 3.13	
BATTERIES	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	
BATTERY AA 24-PK	238	24	PK	458914	DURACELL COMPANY	MN1500B240001	\$ 12.29	
BATTERY 9-VOLT	122	1	EA	1370863	DURACELL COMPANY	MN16B4DW	\$ 9.50	
BATTERY AAA 12-PK	462	12	PK	571373	DURACELL COMPANY	MN24RT12Z22	\$ 7.09	
BATTERY AAA 4-PK	160	4	EA	395648	DURACELL COMPANY	MN2400B4Z	\$ 2.49	
BATTERY SIZE C	35	4	PK	405427	DURACELL COMPANY	MN1400R4ZX	\$ 5.32	
BATTERY SIZE D, 8-PK	25	1	EA	1370854	DURACELL COMPANY	MN13R8DW	\$ 9.50	
BINDERS/DIVIDERS/FOLDERS/INSERTS/ORGANIZERS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
8-POCKET PROJECT ORGANIZER	8503	1	EA	678294	OFFICE DEPOT	OD05306	\$ 1.01	
BINDER, 3 RING, VINYL 2"	267	1	EA	471880	OFFICE DEPOT	OD03364	\$ 1.82	
BINDER, 3 RING, VINYL 3"	303	1	EA	471907	OFFICE DEPOT	OD03365	\$ 2.64	
BINDER, 3 RING, VINYL 0.5"	543	1	EA	471835	OFFICE DEPOT	OD03361	\$ 1.06	
BINDER, 3 RING, VINYL 1"	1750	1	EA	471844	OFFICE DEPOT	OD03362	\$ 1.06	
BINDER, 3 RING, VINYL 1.5"	1466	1	EA	207316	OFFICE DEPOT	OD02824	\$ 2.12	

BINDER, 3 RING, VINYL, CLEAR OVERLAY 2"	954	1	EA	209692	OFFICE DEPOT	OD02962	\$ 2.23
BINDER, 3 RING, VINYL, CLEAR OVERLAY 3"	211	1	EA	396201	OFFICE DEPOT	OD02786	\$ 1.93
BINDER, 3 RING, VINYL, CLEAR OVERLAY 0.5"	356	1	EA	396941	OFFICE DEPOT	OD02772	\$ 1.01
BINDER, 3 RING, VINYL, CLEAR OVERLAY 1"	3572	1	EA	396291	OFFICE DEPOT	OD02765	\$ 0.98
BINDER, 3 RING, VINYL, CLEAR OVERLAY 1.5"	1403	1	EA	396251	OFFICE DEPOT	OD02769	\$ 1.16
FOLDER 8-PKT POLY ASSORTED COLORS	2995			NO BID			
FOLDER FILE LETTER 1/3-CUT TAB 100-PK	1434	100	BX	543280	OFFICE DEPOT	OD752 1/3OD752 1/3	\$ 5.59
FOLDER HANGING LETTER 25-PK	403	25	BX	810994	OFFICE DEPOT	OM97187/810994OD	\$ 3.41
FOLDER HANGING PENDAFLEX GLOW LETTER 5-TAB ASST 25-PK	145	25	BX	626023	OFFICE DEPOT	81672	\$ 7.36
FOLDER.COMMUNICATION.SUB TEACHER-SEC.9 1/2X11 5/8.12	109	1	EA	270640	SCHOLASTIC INC	9.78044E+12	\$ 0.98
PORTFOLIO 3PRONG ASSORTED COLORS 2 POCKET 25-PK	1072	25	BX	552456	OFFICE DEPOT	OD552456	\$ 4.62
PORTFOLIO ASSORTED COLORS 2 POCKET 25-PK	1761	25	BX	698878	OFFICE DEPOT	OD698878	\$ 3.19
PORTFOLIO ASSORTED COLORS 9X12 2 POCKET 25-PK	198	25	BX	698860	OFFICE DEPOT	OD698860	\$ 3.45
PORTFOLIO POLY 3PRONG ASSORTED COLORS 2 POCKET 25-PK	872	1	EA	202334	OFFICE DEPOT	89206	\$ 0.48
PORTFOLIO POLY ASSORTED COLORS 2 POCKET25-PK	634	10	TP	249257	OFFICE DEPOT	ODU-REP69	\$ 2.44
PROTECTOR SHEET TOP LOAD 100-PK	1232	100	BX	498811	OFFICE DEPOT	OD498811	\$ 3.26
TAB DIVIDERS ERASABLE 11X9	5989	10	ST	622788	AVERY PRODUCTS CORPORATION	3585499240	\$ 0.48

CALCULATORS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE
8-DIGIT HANDHELD CALCULATOR	173	1	EA	806817	KARCE CO LIMITED	KC-420	\$ 1.23
TI-10 Calculator 10-PK	13	1	EA	670266	D&H DISTRIBUTING	TI10TK	\$ 89.43
TI-108/BK CALCULATOR	44			NO BID			
TI-108/TK CALCULATOR KIT 10-PK	118	1	EA	949725	D&H DISTRIBUTING	TI108TK	\$ 35.40
TI-15/BK EXPLORER CALCULATOR	73	1	EA	568825	TEXAS INSTRUMENTS INC	15/TBL/2L1/A	\$ 13.43
TI-15/TK EXPLORER CALCULATOR KIT 10-PK	220			NO BID			
TI-30X IIS SCIENTIFIC CALCULATOR	155	1	EA	176928	TEXAS INSTRUMENTS INC	TI-30X IIS	\$ 9.89
TI-30X IIS SCIENTIFIC CALCULATOR 10-PK	13			NO BID			
TI-30XA SCIENTIFIC CALCULATOR	184	1	EA	618033	TEXAS INSTRUMENTS INC	TI-30XA	\$ 7.49
TI-30XS CALCULATOR	95	1	EA	617135	TEXAS INSTRUMENTS INC	30XSMV/TBL/1L1/A	\$ 11.24
TI-34MV SCIENTIFIC CALCULATOR	100	1	EA	372311	TEXAS INSTRUMENTS INC	34II/FBL/1L1/A	\$ 14.49
TI-73 EXPLORER GRAPHING CALCULATOR	95	1	EA	905757	TEXAS INSTRUMENTS INC	TI-73ST	\$ 56.48

CARTS/ORGANIZERS/STORAGE	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
BOX UTILITY 8.5 X 5 X 2	486	1	EA	452396	REALLY USEFUL PRODUCTS LTD	0.55C	\$ 1.25	
CLASSROOM KEEPER MAILBOX 30 SLOT	62			NO BID				
TOTE PLASTIC 12 X 8 X 5	707	1	EA	773118	IRIS USA INC	101412	\$ 1.25	

CLAY/DOUGH	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
CLAY AIR DRY 25 LB	253	1	EA	864822	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	AMA46319S	\$ 13.74	
CLAY HIGH FIRE STONEWARE 50-LB	34			NO BID				
CLAY LOW FIRE EARTHENWARE 25-LB WHITE	192	1	EA	673833	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	AMA46318R	\$ 13.74	
CLAY LOW FIRE EARTHENWARE 50-LB	153			NO BID				
CLAY MODELING 1-LB	368	1	LB	340802	DIXON TICONDEROGA CO	740	\$ 1.28	

CLAY MODELING 5-LB	110	6	PK	255723	SP RICHARDS	CKC4099	\$ 14.14
DOUGH CRAYOLA MODEL MAGIC CLASSPACK OF 75-1 OZ PKGS	101	75	CA	527992	CRAYOLA LLC	23-6001	\$ 20.28
PLAYDOH MEGA PACK SET OF 36	136	6	CA	173774	HOFFMAN TECHNOLOGIES INC	A2762H6	\$ 19.17
PLAY-DOH SUPER COLOR PACK SET OF 20	158			NO BID			
SOFT-KUT RUBBER PRINT BLOCKS 4 X 6	520			NO BID			

CLIP BINDERS/PAPER CLIPS/STAPLES	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE
CLIP BINDER SMALL 3/4" 12-PK	607	12	BX	808857	OFFICEMATE INTL	99020	\$ 0.24
CLIP BINDER MEDIUM 1 1/4" BLACK 12-PK	1822	1	BX	429431	AIVEN ON STATIONERY CO LTD	825190BX	\$ 0.41
CLIP BINDER ASSORTED SIZE 30-PK	244	1	EA	371541	OFFICEMATE INTL	31026	\$ 1.97
CLIP BINDER LARGE 2" BLACK 12-PK	531	12	BX	963439	OFFICEMATE INTL	99100	\$ 1.60
CLIP BINDER MINI 9/16" 12-PK	155	12	BX	909309	OFFICEMATE INTL	99010	\$ 0.19
CLIP MAGNET MAN RED	478	12	BD	352706	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	ASH10230BN	\$ 13.50
PAPERCLIPS NON-SKID 1-1/4" 100-BOX	545	1	BX	429266	OFFICEMATE INTL	10001BX	\$ 0.14
PAPERCLIPS NON-SKID 2" 100-BOX	1170	200	BX	550639	SP RICHARDS	SPR01604	\$ 1.04
PAPERCLIPS SMOOTH 1-1/4" 1000-PK	1075	10	PK	308478	OFFICEMATE INTL	10001	\$ 1.36
PAPERCLIPS SMOOTH 2" 1000-PK	2043	100	BX	358180	OFFICEMATE INTL	10014	\$ 0.48
PAPERCLIPS VINYL 1-1/4" 100-BOX	158	500	PK	621009	AIVEN ON STATIONERY CO LTD	LF-73	\$ 1.24
PAPERCLIPS VINYL 2" 100-BOX	243	200	PK	656289	AIVEN ON STATIONERY CO LTD	LF-72	\$ 1.29
STAPLES HEAVY DUTY TACKER 1000-PK	13	1	BX	527691	SP RICHARDS	BOSTRA708T	\$ 1.81
STAPLES STANDARD ,SWINGLINE SPEED POINT SF4 5000-PK	78	5000	BX	221051	ACCO BRANDS USA LLC	35450	\$ 1.77
STAPLES STANDARD 210/STRIP 5000-PK	2880	5000	BX	749601	OFFICE DEPOT	2661	\$ 0.44

CONSTRUCTION/BOND/DRAWING/ROLL PAPER	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
PAPER BOND ASTROBRIGHTS 24LB 8.5X11 ASST REAM	133	500	RM	170719	NEENAH PAPER INC	21289	\$ 7.55	
PAPER BOND ASTROBRIGHTS 24LB 8.5X11 SINGLE COLOR REAM	149	1	RM	255815	NEENAH PAPER INC	21658	\$ 5.97	
PAPER COLORED ART 12x18 50-PK	166	50	PK	653180	PACON CORP	102941	\$ 1.88	
PAPER CONSTRUCTION 12X18 ASST COLOR 50-PK	485	50	PK	105461	PACON CORP	103638	\$ 1.33	
PAPER CONSTRUCTION 12X18 SINGLE COLOR 100-PK	621			NO BID				
PAPER CONSTRUCTION 12X18 SINGLE COLOR 50-PK	7792			NO BID				
PAPER CONSTRUCTION 9X12 ASST COLOR 50-PK	1308	50	PK	338855	PACON CORP	103031EA	\$ 0.97	
PAPER CONSTRUCTION 9X12 SINGLE COLOR 100-PK	3891			NO BID				
PAPER CONSTRUCTION 9X12 SINGLE COLOR 50-PK	14993	50	PK	273995	PACON CORP	103607EA	\$ 0.68	
PAPER CONSTRUCTION MULTI_CULTURAL 9x12 50-PK	244	50	PK	350019	PACON CORP	9509	\$ 1.77	
PAPER DRAWING 9x12 50# WHITE REAM	277	500	RM	313852	SP RICHARDS	PAC4739	\$ 8.83	
PAPER DRAWING 9x12 80# WHITE REAM	145	500	RM	172718	PACON CORP	4809	\$ 8.72	
PAPER DUO KRAFT ROLL 40# 36X1000	514	1	RL	502681	PACON CORP	63000	\$ 43.11	
PAPER ROLL 36"x1000'	505	1	RL	502751	PACON CORP	63300	\$ 40.33	
PAPER ROLL 48"x200'	346	1	RL	185074	SP RICHARDS	PAC67004	\$ 16.40	

COPY PAPER	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE
PAPER, COPY, 8.5X11, 20LB, COLORED REAM	1190	500	RM	345686	DOMTAR PAPER CO LLC	3R05861	\$ 3.69
PAPER,COPY,8.5X11,20LB, 92 BRT, 10 REAMS/CASE	1343	10	CA	196517	BOISE PAPER	OX9001-CTN	\$ 27.99

CRAYONS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
CRAYONS CRAYOLA 16 COLOR ASST OR EQUIVALENT	118	16	BX	565528	CRAYOLA LLC	52-3016	\$ 0.80	
CRAYONS CRAYOLA 16 COLOR CLASSPACK ASST 800 PK OR EQUIVALENT	70	800	BX	360345	CRAYOLA LLC	52-8016	\$ 31.89	
CRAYONS CRAYOLA 24 COLOR OR EQUIVALENT	1006	1	EA	434252	CRAYOLA LLC	53-3024	\$ 0.98	
CRAYONS CRAYOLA 64 COLOR CLASSPACK PACK OF 832 OR EQUIVALENT	65	1	BX	822069	SP RICHARDS	CY0528019	\$ 44.07	
CRAYONS CRAYOLA 8 COLOR ASST CLASS 800-PK OR EQUIVALENT	152	800	BX	723072	CRAYOLA LLC	52-8008	\$ 33.39	
CRAYONS CRAYOLA 8 COLOR ASST OR EQUIVALENT	386	8	BX	950162	CRAYOLA LLC	52-0008	\$ 0.41	
CRAYONS CRAYOLA MULTICULTURAL STD SIZE SET OF 8 OR EQUIVALENT	337	8	BX	949164	CRAYOLA LLC	52-008W	\$ 0.53	
CRAYONS CRAYOLA REFILL STD SIZE 12-PACK OR EQUIVALENT	817	12	BX	535088	CRAYOLA LLC	52-0836-042	\$ 0.92	
CRAYONS CRAYOLA TUCK STD SET OF 12 OR EQUIVALENT	268	16	BX	278280	SCHOLASTIC INC	SFTC-CR-16	\$ 0.36	
CRAYONS CRAYOLA TUCK STD SIZE SET OF 16 OR EQUIVALENT	376	16	BX	278280	SCHOLASTIC INC	SFTC-CR-16	\$ 0.36	
CRAYONS CRAYOLA TUCK STD SIZE SET OF 24 OR EQUIVALENT	3671	24	BX	278392	SCHOLASTIC INC	SFTC-CR-24	\$ 0.48	
CRAYONS CRAYOLA TUCK STD SIZE SET OF 8 OR EQUIVALENT	1667	8	BX	950162	CRAYOLA LLC	52-0008	\$ 0.41	
DRY ERASE MARKERS/SUPPLIES	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
CLEANER, BOARD, DRY ERASE, 128 OZ	43	1	GA	127731	SANFORD LP	81800	\$ 16.09	
CLEANER, BOARD, DRY ERASE, 22 OZ	149	1	EA	775660	SANFORD LP	1752229	\$ 5.06	
CLEANER, BOARD, DRY ERASE, 8 OZ	559	1	EA	204057	SANFORD LP	81803	\$ 2.02	
DRY ERASE CLOTH, MICROFIBER, 12x14 6-PK	90	1	EA	774435	SANFORD LP	1752313	\$ 3.00	
ERASER DRY ERASE	2465	1	EA	307512	SANFORD LP	81505	\$ 1.63	
ERASER DRY ERASE 12-PK	167			NO BID				
MARKER DRY ERASE EXPO BULLET ASST COLOR 4-PK OR EQUIVALENT	564	4	ST	927756	SANFORD LP	82074	\$ 3.28	
MARKER DRY ERASE EXPO BULLET ASST COLOR 8-PK OR EQUIVALENT	241	8	ST	345997	SANFORD LP	80078	\$ 6.44	
MARKER DRY ERASE EXPO BULLET BLACK 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	107	12	DZ	256901	SANFORD LP	82001	\$ 9.66	
MARKER DRY ERASE EXPO CHSEL TIP ASST COLOR 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	121	12	PK	266704	SANFORD LP	83087	\$ 10.34	
MARKER DRY ERASE EXPO CHSEL TIP ASST COLOR 4-PK OR EQUIVALENT	296	4	PK	284571	SANFORD LP	80174	\$ 3.26	
MARKER DRY ERASE EXPO CHSEL TIP ASST COLOR 8-PK OR EQUIVALENT	135	8	CG	890939	SANFORD LP	1944741	\$ 7.34	
MARKER DRY ERASE EXPO CHSEL TIP BLACK 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	1307	12	DZ	259251	SANFORD LP	80001	\$ 9.43	
MARKER DRY ERASE EXPO CHSEL TIP ASST BOLD 16-PK OR EQUIVALENT	237	16	PK	856080	SANFORD LP	81045	\$ 12.55	
MARKER DRY ERASE EXPO FINE BLACK 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	352	12	DZ	738753	OFFICE DEPOT	DE-12PKBLK	\$ 2.12	
STUDENT BOARD DRY ERASE 8x12	554	1	EA	439771	ACCO BRANDS USA LLC	12-900962	\$ 1.18	
STUDENT BOARD DRY ERASE 9x12 - 10 PK	352	1	ST	153620	SP RICHARDS	CKC988110	\$ 22.87	
STUDENT BOARD DRY ERASE 9x12 - 30 PK	165	12	ST	721997	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	CHL35036	\$ 20.61	
STUDENT BOARD DRY ERASE 9x12 - EACH	228	1	EA	674294	PACON CORP	AC9881	\$ 1.62	
STUDENT BOARD DRY ERASE 9x12 LINED - EACH	264	12	BD	636269	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	CHL35115BN	\$ 18.65	
GLUE/TAPE	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
ADHESIVE REUSABLE PUTTY 1 OZ	519	1	EA	584296	3M CO	860	\$ 0.83	
GLUE ART PASTE 2OZ EACH	247			NO BID				
GLUE ELMER'S SCHOOL 1-GAL OR EQUIVALENT	248	1	EA	205351	ELMERS PRODUCTS INC	E340NR	\$ 7.73	
GLUE ELMER'S SCHOOL 4OZ OR EQUIVALENT	1651	1	EA	947432	ELMERS PRODUCTS INC	E304NR	\$ 0.51	

GLUE ELMER'S SCHOOL 8OZ OR EQUIVALENT	448	1	EA	205344	ELMERS PRODUCTS INC	E308NR	\$	0.91
GLUE STICK ALL TEMP 7/16IN DIAM X 4IN LONG 20-PK	123	5	PK	453815	SP RICHARDS	BOSGS20DT	\$	3.56
GLUE STICK ALL TEMP 7/16IN DIAM X 4IN LONG 50-PK	252	5	PK	453815	SP RICHARDS	BOSGS20DT	\$	3.56
GLUE STICK ELMER'S .24OZ CLEAR 30-PK OR EQUIVALENT	349	30	PK	698325	ELMERS PRODUCTS INC	E556	\$	5.14
GLUE STICK ELMER'S .24OZ PURPLE 30-PK OR EQUIVALENT	202	30	PK	698283	ELMERS PRODUCTS INC	E555	\$	5.12
GLUE STICK ELMER'S .24OZ PURPLE 60-PK OR EQUIVALENT	124	60	BX	557759	SP RICHARDS	EPIE503	\$	15.68
GLUE STICK ELMER'S .24OZ WHITE 60-PK OR EQUIVALENT	206	60	PK	478703	ELMERS PRODUCTS INC	E501	\$	12.91
GLUE STICK ELMER'S .28OZ CLEAR OR EQUIVALENT	481	4	PK	438731	SCHOLASTIC INC	95096-OD	\$	0.56
GLUE STICK ELMER'S .28OZ WHITE 30-PK OR EQUIVALENT	855	18	PK	711744	SCHOLASTIC INC	95308-OD	\$	2.53
GLUE STICK ELMER'S .28OZ WHITE12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	521	12	PK	571101	SCHOLASTIC INC	95306-OD	\$	1.48
GLUE STICK ELMER'S WASHABLE .21OZ OR EQUIVALENT	283	8	PK	327919	ELMERS PRODUCTS INC	E1591	\$	1.99
GLUE STICK ELMER'S WASHABLE .77OZ OR EQUIVALENT	342	6	PK	571121	SCHOLASTIC INC	95189-OD	\$	1.52
GLUE STICK ELMER'S.28OZ PURPLE 30-PK OR EQUIVALENT	346	30	PK	698283	ELMERS PRODUCTS INC	E555	\$	5.12
TAPE 3M VINYL FLOOR MARKING - 1 IN X 36 YD ROLL OR EQUIVALENT	110	1	RL	834599	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	CHS1X36FTYL	\$	2.19
TAPE BOOK 1.5"X15YD	235	1	RL	958033	3M CO	845-1-1/2	\$	2.80
TAPE DOUBLE-SIDED PERMANENT 1/2IN X 250IN 3 PK	159	3	PK	391775	3M CO	3136	\$	2.60
TAPE DUCT 1.88" 48MM 20 YD	121	1	RL	226529	3M CO	P2425	\$	5.29
TAPE MASKING GENERAL PURPOSE 1"X60YD	1182	1	RL	666537	3M CO	2600-1	\$	0.97
TAPE MASKING GENERAL PURPOSE 1/2"X60YD	490	1	RL	998088	3M CO	234-12	\$	3.75
TAPE MASKING GENERAL PURPOSE 2"X60YD	144	1	RL	666511	3M CO	2600-2	\$	2.32
TAPE MASKING GENERAL PURPOSE 3/4"X60YD	544	1	RL	666529	3M CO	260034	\$	0.87
TAPE MAVALUS REMOVABLE POSTER 3/4"X360"	373	1	EA	508218	3M CO	109	\$	2.19
TAPE PACKING 1.88"X54.6YD HEAVY-DUTY 6-PK	102	6	PK	568419	3M CO	OD-HM50-6	\$	5.58
TAPE PACKING 1.88"X54.6YD MEDIUM-DUTY 6-PK	401	6	PK	220690	3M CO	OD-A19-6	\$	3.22
TAPE PERMANENT MENDING 3/4"X36YD EACH	162	2	PK	602710	3M CO	237-DM2	\$	2.93
TAPE TRANSPARENT 1" CORE 1/2"X36YD 12-PK	316	2	PK	598668	3M CO	600H2	\$	2.00
TAPE TRASNPARENT 1" CORE 3/4"X36YD 12-PK	948	16	PK	473576	3M CO	OD-IB3436-16	\$	9.05

INDEX CARDS/CARD STOCK	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
CARDSTOCK 65LB ASTROBRIGHTS ASST COLOR 8.5X11 PK-250 OR EQUIV	163	250	RM	925292	NEENAH PAPER INC	98853	\$	7.49
CARDSTOCK 65LB ASTROBRIGHTS SINGLE COLOR 8.5X11 PK-250 OR EQU	594	250	PK	424367	NEENAH PAPER INC	21738	\$	6.49
CARDSTOCK 65LB ASTROBRIGHTS WHITE 8.5X11 PK-250 OR EQUIVALEN	266	250	PK	423983	NEENAH PAPER INC	21408	\$	6.49
CARTSTOCK 65LB ARRAY ASST 8.5X11 PK-100 OR EQUIVALENT	176	250	PK	458411	NEENAH PAPER INC	21004	\$	7.49
CARTSTOCK 65LB ARRAY WHITE 8.5X11 PK-100 OR EQUIVALENT	453	250	PK	458621	NEENAH PAPER INC	91904	\$	6.49
INDEX CARDS 3X5 BLANK WHITE 100-PK	1136	100	PK	804286	OFFICE DEPOT	40150-SP	\$	0.24
INDEX CARDS 3X5 NARROW RULE WHITE 100-PK	3812	100	PK	186348	OFFICE DEPOT	OD40153	\$	0.22
INDEX CARDS 3X5 RULED WHITE 100-PK	412	100	PK	186348	OFFICE DEPOT	OD40153	\$	0.22
INDEX CARDS 4X6 BLANK WHITE 100-PK	171	100	PK	292997	OFFICE DEPOT	40	\$	0.70
INDEX CARDS 4X6 NARROW RULE WHITE 100-PK	334	100	PK	193490	OFFICE DEPOT	OD63525	\$	0.94
INDEX CARDS 4X6 RULED WHITE 100-PK	109	100	PK	193490	OFFICE DEPOT	OD63525	\$	0.94
TAGBOARD 12 X 18 125# WHITE 100-PK	103	100	PK	253032	PACON CORP	190102-11980	\$	5.56
TAGBOARD 9X12 125# WHITE 100-PK	466	100	PK	208593	PACON CORP	PAC5211	\$	4.74

LAMINATING FILM	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE
LAMINATING FILM 1.5ML 18" X 500' 1" CORE	123		2 PK	320264	ACCO BRANDS USA LLC	3000003B	\$ 51.02

LAMINATING FILM 1.5ML 27" X 500' 1" CORE	501	2 PK	514608 ACCO BRANDS USA LLC	3126061B	\$ 55.07
LAMINATING FILM,1.5MIL 25" X 500', 1" CORE	1581	2 PK	492864 ACCO BRANDS USA LLC	3000004B	\$ 39.37
LAMINATING POUCH,LETTER SIZE 9X11.5 3MIL PK 100	320	50 PK	535704 ACCO BRANDS USA LLC	5357040DB	\$ 5.92

MISCELLANEOUS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
ACCELEROMETER PEDOMETER-ACCUSPLIT - STEPS ONLY	539	1	EA	192338	D&H DISTRIBUTING	WV1055BK	\$ 10.90	
BORDETTE SCALLOPED 2.25" X 50'	224	1	RL	173823	PACON CORP	37034	\$ 1.77	
CALENDAR DESK PAD (JANUARY - DECEMBER)	101	1	EA	304052	ACCO BRANDS CORP	SP24D0017	\$ 1.25	
CALENDAR DESK PAD ACADEMIC YEAR (JULY - AUGUST)	350	1	EA	597938	ACCO BRANDS CORP	SK24160017	\$ 5.89	
CLIPBOARD MASONITE LETTER	3046	1	EA	991992	OFFICEMATE INTL	83140	\$ 0.51	
CLOCK 13" WALL - WHITE DIAL/BLACK FRAME	113	1	EA	706454	MZ BERGER & COMPANY INC	ODX902	\$ 4.79	
COMPASS METAL WITH PENCIL HOLDER	135	1	EA	765710	SP RICHARDS	CHA401N	\$ 8.70	
CORRECTION TAPE WITE-OUT EZ CORRECT 4-PK BICWOTAPP418 OR EQ	196	1	PK	581985	BIC CORP	WOTAPP418	\$ 3.32	
CORRECTION FLUID LIQUID PAPER WHT 3-PK OR EQUIVALENT	115	3	PK	408344	SANFORD LP	56431	\$ 2.60	
CORRECTION FLUID LIQUID PAPER WHT OR EQUIVALENT	840	2	PK	147544	SANFORD LP	42032	\$ 3.95	
CORRECTION TAPE SINGLE LINE .2INX39.4FT WHITE BICWOTAPP11 OR E	302	1	EA	429638	BIC CORP	WOTAPP11	\$ 1.10	
CORRECTION TAPE WITE-OUT EZ CORRECT WHITE PACK OF 10 BICWOTA	112	10	PK	826876	BIC CORP	WOTAP10	\$ 9.48	
CUISINAIRE RODS MULTI-PACK CONNECTING	144	444	BX	844700	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	LER7481	\$ 39.82	
DICTIONARY AND THESAURUS PAPERBACK M WEBSTER	458	1	EA	525136	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	MW-7326	\$ 11.85	
DICTIONARY PAPERBACK M WEBSTER	140	1	EA	882776	SP RICHARDS	MER636	\$ 8.74	
DODGEBALL RHINOSKIN ASST COLOR 6-PK	78	6	ST	895077	SP RICHARDS	CSIRS65SET	\$ 42.98	
EARBUD - ECONOMY WITH 3.5 MM PLUG	398	1	EA	824487	INGRAM MICRO INC	T37913	\$ 2.59	
FLASH CARDS ADDITION (0-12)	228	1	PK	150575	SP RICHARDS	CDPCD3928	\$ 4.71	
FLASH CARDS MULTIPLICAION	243	1	PK	150603	SP RICHARDS	CDPCD3930	\$ 4.71	
FLASH CARDS SUBTRACTION (0-12)	218	1	PK	150610	SP RICHARDS	CDPCD3931	\$ 4.71	
GLUE GUN FULL SIZE 40 WATT DUAL TEMP	125	1	EA	764206	SP RICHARDS	FPRDT270	\$ 4.78	
HEADPHONES W/VOLUME CONTROL 3.5MM PLUG & 1/4 INCH ADAPTER	2601	1	EA	457896	SKULLCANDY INC	X6DPHY-835	\$ 14.56	
HOLE PUNCH 1-HOLE NICKEL PLATED	348	1	EA	825232	OFFICE DEPOT	K00114A	\$ 0.52	
HOLE PUNCH 3-HOLE	182	1	EA	427151	OFFICE DEPOT	999/ODP-MPB	\$ 3.41	
INSTANT COLD PACK	483	24	CT	745904	SP RICHARDS	HLV59688	\$ 20.47	
LABEL LASER AVERY 5160 3000-PK OR EQUIVALENT	68	3000	BX	364364	AVERY PRODUCTS CORPORATION	5160	\$ 14.74	
LIGHT FILTER COZY SHADE 24X54" 4-PK	81	4	PK	331340	EDUCATORS RESOURCE INC	EI-1231	\$ 20.83	
LINOLEUM UNMOUNTED 4X6	185			NO BID				
LINOLEUM UNMOUNTED 6X9	100			NO BID				
NOTES SELF STICK BRIGHTS POP UP 3 X 3 12-PK	214	12	PK	843877	3M CO	OD-3312PB	\$ 4.78	
NOTES SELF STICK NEON POP UP 3 X 3 12-PK	201	12	PK	723688	3M CO	OD-3312PD	\$ 4.78	
NOTES SELF STICK PASTEL POP UP 3 X 3 12-PK	363	12	PK	180366	3M CO	OD-3312PA	\$ 4.19	
NOTES SELF STICK YELLOW POP UP 3 X 3 12-PK	530	12	PK	843787	3M CO	OD-3312PY	\$ 3.33	
PAPER CLIP HOLDER MAGNETIC SMOKE/BLACK	132	1	EA	907659	SP RICHARDS	OIC93690	\$ 0.68	
PENCIL CASE PLASTIC SLIDER ASST COLORS	492	1	EA	346203	ADVANTUS CORP	65343	\$ 0.67	
PENCIL GRIP TRIANGULAR 12-PK	136	25	PK	595233	OFFICE DEPOT	GRP25	\$ 0.85	
PENCIL POUCH	258	1	EA	276059	OFFICE DEPOT	PPCW201401	\$ 0.75	
PIPE CLEANERS 12 ASST COLORS 100-PK	787	100	PK	270801	PACON CORP	AC7110-01	\$ 1.86	
PIPE CLEANERS SINGLE COLOR 100-PK	100	100	BG	507159	SP RICHARDS	CKC711008	\$ 1.88	
PRIVACY BOARD 48 X 16 4-PK	149			NO BID				
SECURITY LOG/ADHESIVE VISITOR BADGE 8 1/2 X 11	189	100	BX	141441	SP RICHARDS	CLI97004	\$ 13.80	

STAPLER FULL STRIP BLACK	1096	1	EA	908210	ACCO BRANDS USA LLC	54501	\$	3.75
STUDENT ADMIT SLIP 5 1/2X8 5/8 3/PAGE CARBONLESS	1100			NO BID				
STUDENT TARDY SLIP 8 1/2 X 11 6/PAGE CARBONLESS	323			NO BID				
TAPE DISPENSER 1" CORE	689	1	EA	520328	3M CO	41001-OD	\$	1.57
TIMER DIGITAL	444	1	EA	699942	PETRA INDUSTRIES INC	TAP5806	\$	4.49
TISSUE FACIAL BOX 100 SHEETS	1242	1	EA	509601	ESSENDANT CO	MAC 2930EA	\$	0.50
VELCRO HOOK AND LOOP 3/4" 200-PK	111			NO BID				
VELCRO HOOK AND LOOPWAFER THIN 40-PK	108	40	PK	725193	SP RICHARDS	VEK91386	\$	2.34
PAINT/CANVAS/BRUSHES	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
BRUSH BRISTLE 1/2	165	1	EA	182224	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	76801	\$	9.11
BRUSH BRISTLE 1/4	197	1	EA	905838	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	35957	\$	10.14
CANVAS PANEL 11 X 14	1918	1	EA	689269	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	22026-PK2	\$	13.46
CANVAS PANEL 12 X 16	546	1	EA	693076	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	22072-PK2	\$	16.42
CANVAS PANEL 14 X 18	858	1	EA	295944	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	11838-PK2	\$	19.11
CANVAS PANEL 16 X 20	206	1	EA	691303	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	22031-PK2	\$	21.24
CANVAS PANEL 8 X 10	2877	1	EA	431167	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	22088-PK2	\$	17.47
CANVAS PANEL 9 X 12	1976	1	EA	435523	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	22065-PK2	\$	12.08
PAINT ACRYLIC HALF GALLON	288	1	EA	847419	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	65232	\$	19.23
PAINT ACRYLIC PINT	160	1	EA	949909	CRAYOLA LLC	20-4016-570	\$	4.09
PAINT ACRYLIC QUART	86	1	EA	949867	CRAYOLA LLC	20-4016-432	\$	4.09
PAINT PUMP FOR GALLON AND HALF GALLON JAR	317			NO BID				
PAINT TEMPERA PINT	342	1	EA	290243	RICH ART COLOR	LF-16-24	\$	1.46
PAINT TEMPERA QUART	276	1	EA	465238	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	37271	\$	5.99
PAINT TEMPERA VERSATEMP GALLON OR EQUIVALENT	388	1	EA	465409	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	70064	\$	17.45
PAINT TEMPERA WASHABLE GALLON	223	1	EA	219469	CRAYOLA LLC	54-2128-3-034	\$	13.07
PAINT TEMPERA WASHABLE PINT	724	1	EA	290558	RICH ART COLOR	C-16-62	\$	1.26
PAINT TEMPERA WASHABLE PINT ASST 12-PK	139	12	PK	290747	RICH ART COLOR	C16-12	\$	14.74
PAINT TEMPERA WASHABLE QUART	281	12	PK	290747	RICH ART COLOR	C16-12	\$	14.74
PAINT WTRCLR CRAYOLA WASH OVAL SET OF 16 OR EQUIVALENT	96	1	EA	673533	CRAYOLA LLC	53-0555	\$	1.89
PAINT WTRCLR CRAYOLA OVAL SET OF 16 OR EQUIVALENT	183	1	ST	261283	SP RICHARDS	DIX16000	\$	5.21
PAINT WTRCLR CRAYOLA OVAL REFILL SET OF 6 OR EQUIVALENT	175			NO BID				
PAINT WTRCLRS CRAYOLA OVAL SET OF 8 WASHABLE OR EQUIVALENT	603	1	ST	548743	CRAYOLA LLC	53-0525	\$	1.13
PAINT WTRCLRS CRAYOLA OVAL SET OF 8 OR EQUIVALENT	832	8	ST	951962	DIXON TICONDEROGA CO	80525	\$	1.02
PENCILS/PENS/ERASERS/MARKERS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
ERASER ART GUM 1X1X3/4 24-PK	44	12	DZ	149088	SANFORD LP	73201	\$	5.60
ERASER ART GUM 1x1x7/8	150	1	EA	107613	SANFORD LP	73028	\$	0.28
ERASER CAPS ASST COLOR 100-PK	631	100	PK	157302	KLEENSLATE CONCEPTS LP	6320	\$	32.38
ERASER CAPS PINK/RED 144-PK	2470	144	GS	686139	SANFORD LP	73015	\$	3.97
ERASER PINK BEVELED MEDIUM 12-PK	110	24	BX	279632	OFFICE DEPOT	BG279632	\$	1.06
ERASER PINK BEVELED SMALL 36-PK	120	36	BX	139720	OFFICE DEPOT	BG139720	\$	1.10
ERASER PINK BLOCK MEDIUM 60-PK	101	36	BX	139720	OFFICE DEPOT	BG139720	\$	1.10
HIGHLIGHTER BRITE LINER ASST 5-PK	190	5	PK	942742	BIC CORP	BLP51W-AST	\$	1.10

HIGHLIGHTER BRITE LINER GRIP XL ASST 4-PK	145	5	PK	745971	BIC CORP	GBLP51	\$ 1.43
HIGHLIGHTER PEN ASST 20-PK	252	20	PK	813112	SANFORD LP	25018	\$ 7.58
HIGHLIGHTER PEN ASST 6-PK	273	6	PK	877678	OFFICE DEPOT	P-2111BAST6/6	\$ 0.87
HIGHLIGHTER PEN YELLOW 12-PK	160	12	DZ	469919	OFFICE DEPOT	P-2111BYE12	\$ 1.80
HIGHLIGHTER PEN YELLOW 20-PK	112	12	DZ	128844	OFFICE DEPOT	HY1066-YL	\$ 1.90
HIGHLIGHTER POCKET STYLE ASST 12-PK	148	12	DZ	469829	OFFICE DEPOT	P-2111BAST12/6	\$ 1.80
MARKER PERMANENT ASST PK/8	127	8	PK	820090	SANFORD LP	30078	\$ 4.55
MARKER ASSORTED FINE SHARPIE 24-PK OR EQUIVALENT	137	24	PK	717936	SANFORD LP	1927350	\$ 13.35
MARKER BLACK EXTRA FINE SHARPIE 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	203	12	DZ	451898	SANFORD LP	37001	\$ 6.76
MARKER BLACK FINE SHARPIE 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	590	12	DZ	203349	SANFORD LP	30001	\$ 6.75
MARKER BLACK FINE SHARPIE 36-PK OR EQUIVALENT	90	1	PK	1390240	SANFORD LP	1884739	\$ 18.39
MARKER BLACK FINE SHARPIE EACH OR EQUIVALENT	97	1	EA	797125	SP RICHARDS	SAN30051	\$ 0.59
MARKER BLACK ULTRA FINE SHARPIE 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	129	12	DZ	781323	OFFICE DEPOT	P-2111BBK12UF	\$ 2.55
MARKER CHISEL TIP 8-PK	199	8	PK	268571	SANFORD LP	80678	\$ 6.42
MARKER CRAYOLA BROAD LINE ORIGINAL ASST CLASSPACK OR EQUIVAL	87	256	BX	527664	CRAYOLA LLC	58-8201	\$ 41.77
MARKER CRAYOLA BROAD LINE SINGLE COLOR 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	116	12	BX	361200	CRAYOLA LLC	58-7812	\$ 2.93
MARKER CRAYOLA BROAD LINE WASHABLE CLASSIC ASST 8-PK OR EQUI	382	8	ST	502336	CRAYOLA LLC	58-7808	\$ 1.95
MARKER CRAYOLA CLASSIC CONICAL ASST 8 CT OR EQUIVALENT	150	8	PK	950055	CRAYOLA LLC	58-7708	\$ 1.55
MARKER CRAYOLA CLASSIC FINE ASST 8-PK OR EQUIVALENT	292	8	ST	950063	CRAYOLA LLC	58-7709	\$ 1.58
MARKER CRAYOLA CONICAL ASST 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	98	12	BX	361200	CRAYOLA LLC	58-7812	\$ 2.93
MARKER CRAYOLA CONICAL ASST WASHABLE CLASS PACK	65	200	BX	724062	CRAYOLA LLC	58-8200	\$ 44.34
MARKER CRAYOLA WEDGE WASHABLE CLASSIC ASST 8-PK OR EQUIVALE	428	8	ST	950048	CRAYOLA LLC	58-7208	\$ 2.01
MARKER FLIPCHART NO BLEED ASST 8-PK	283	8	PK	470108	OFFICE DEPOT	FC102607	\$ 2.26
MARKER MR SKETCH SCENTED ASST 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	182	12	ST	203034	SANFORD LP	1905069	\$ 3.00
MARKER MR SKETCH SCENTED ASST FINE PT 10-PK OR EQUIVALENT	107	1	EA	102026	SANFORD LP	1924010	\$ 4.96
MARKERS CRAYOLA BROAD LINE CLASSIC ASST 10-PK OR EQUIVALENT	111	10	PK	764180	CRAYOLA LLC	58-7722	\$ 1.58
MARKERS CRAYOLA FINE CLASSIC ASST 10-PK OR EQUIVALENT	154	10	BX	913819	CRAYOLA LLC	58-7726	\$ 1.54
PEN BALL POINT MEDIUM STICK BLACK 12-PK	520	12	DZ	423582	BIC CORP	GSM11BLK	\$ 0.75
PEN BALL POINT MEDIUM STICK BLUE 12-PK	412	12	DZ	423574	BIC CORP	GSM11BLU	\$ 0.75
PEN BALL POINT MEDIUM STICK PURPLE 12-PK	128	12	DZ	199560	BIC CORP	GSMG11-PPL	\$ 1.20
PEN BALL POINT MEDIUM STICK RED 12-PK	520	12	DZ	423590	BIC CORP	GSM11RED	\$ 0.75
PEN BALLPOINT ANTIMICROBIAL COUNTER BLACK MED	93	1	EA	196063	OFFICE DEPOT	BF-S-1	\$ 0.76
PEN FELT TIP FINE ASST 8-PK	191	1	EA	138311	SANFORD LP	1982056	\$ 7.92
PEN GEL IMPACT BLACK BOLD	96	1	EA	488401	SANFORD LP	65870EA	\$ 1.50
PENCIL #2 W ERASER 12-PK	2083	1	DZ	107580	OFFICE DEPOT	20395EA	\$ 0.56
PENCIL #2 W ERASER 144-PK	1892	144	BX	431774	SP RICHARDS	STD13247C144A	\$ 13.14
PENCIL #2 W ERASER 96-PK	722	6	BX	733601	OFFICE DEPOT	20395	\$ 3.35
PENCIL #2 W ERASER PRE-SHARPENED 12-PK	3702	12	DZ	169229	OFFICE DEPOT	OD_WPCIL_12PK	\$ 0.86
PENCIL #2.5 W ERASER 12-PK	186	12	DZ	811174	SP RICHARDS	DIX13885	\$ 1.88
PENCIL AWARD/HOLIDAY 12-PK	2899			NO BID			
PENCIL BEGINNERS NO. 2 SOFT RND YELLOW DIX13308 12-PK OR EQUIV.	236	12	DZ	340307	DIXON TICONDEROGA CO	13308	\$ 2.46
PENCIL COLORED 10 COLOR 250-PK	99	250	PK	207370	PIDILITE USA INC	22-7200	\$ 18.13
PENCIL COLORED 144-PK	178	144	ST	271627	SP RICHARDS	DIX28144	\$ 31.64
PENCIL CRAYOLA COLORED 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	1577	12	PK	281744	OFFICE DEPOT	SFTC-PL-12	\$ 0.62
PENCIL CRAYOLA COLORED 24-PK OR EQUIVALENT	217	24	PK	281888	OFFICE DEPOT	SFTC-PL-24	\$ 1.26
PENCIL CRAYOLA COLORED 8-PK MULTICULTURAL OR EQUIVALENT	160	8	ST	949990	CRAYOLA LLC	68-4208	\$ 1.15
PENCIL CRAYOLA COLORED 8-PK OR EQUIVALENT	469	1	ST	582062	SP RICHARDS	CYO684008	\$ 1.12
PENCIL LADDIE W/ERASER NO.2 SOFT YELLOW DIX13304 12-PK OR EQUI	317	12	DZ	340281	DIXON TICONDEROGA CO	13304	\$ 2.12

PENCIL MECHANICAL .7MM PK 12	206	12	DZ	959569	SANFORD LP	56043	\$ 17.18
PENCIL PRISMACOLOR VERITHIN 12-PK	279	12	ST	223305	SANFORD LP	2476	\$ 5.79
PENCIL TRIWRITE NO. 2 YELLOW DIX13856 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	276	12	DZ	531472	SP RICHARDS	DIX13856	\$ 2.03

PENCIL SHARPENERS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE
PENCIL SHARPENER 1-HOLE	866	1	EA	588290	MAPED HELIX USA INC	60520	\$ 0.31
PENCIL SHARPENER 2-HOLE	230	1	EA	714755	MAPED HELIX USA INC	69020	\$ 0.68
PENCIL SHARPENER ANTIMICROBIAL	109	1	EA	611266	AMAX INC	MPS1-BLK	\$ 8.33
PENCIL SHARPENER BOSTON KS 8SZS BLK/CHROME EPI1031	399	1	EA	908996	ELMERS PRODUCTS INC	1031	\$ 7.04
PENCIL SHARPENER ELEC 4.5X7X6.5 BLUE/GY EPI1670	334	1	EA	595671	ELMERS PRODUCTS INC	1670	\$ 23.41
PENCIL SHARPENER ELECTRIC X-ACTO TEACHERPRO	314	1	EA	892501	ELMERS PRODUCTS INC	1675	\$ 28.91
PENCIL SHARPENER VERTICAL	234	1	EA	266613	AMAX INC	EPS9V-BLK	\$ 17.37
SHARPENER PENCIL MODLE L STD CHROME/BLK EPI1041	100	1	EA	877670	SP RICHARDS	EPI1041	\$ 12.43

PRESENTATION MATERIALS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE
CHART PAPER 24X16 1 1/2 IN RULED SKIP LINE, 25 SHEET/TABLET	305	1	EA	348048	PACON CORP	74720	\$ 1.63
CHART PAPER 24X16 1IN RULED 25 SHEET/TABLET	335	1	EA	347842	PACON CORP	74620	\$ 1.68
CHART PAPER 24X16 UNRULED 25 SHEETS/TABLET	106	1	EA	347888	SP RICHARDS	PAC74520	\$ 3.10
CHART PAPER 24X32 1 1/2 IN RULED SKIP LINE, 25 SHEET/TABLET	536	1	EA	342006	PACON CORP	74710	\$ 2.82
CHART PAPER 24X32 1 1/2 IN RULED, 70 SHEET/TABLET	112	1	EA	342006	PACON CORP	74710	\$ 2.82
CHART PAPER 24X32 1 IN RULED, 25 SHEET/TABLET	1031	1	EA	329869	PACON CORP	9770	\$ 5.85
CHART PAPER 24X32 UNRULED 25 SHEET/TABLET	182	1	EA	503181	SP RICHARDS	PAC74510	\$ 5.25
CHART PAPER 24X36 1IN RULED 100 SHEET PAD	157	1	EA	677157	SP RICHARDS	PAC74731	\$ 7.65
CHART PAPER 25x30 POST-IT WHT 30 SHEET/PAD 2-PK	222	2	PK	126345	3M CO	559RP	\$ 31.47
EASEL ALUMMINUM TABLE/FLOOR	118	1	EA	613845	BI SILQUE VISUAL COMM	FLX03202-001AA	\$ 22.18
POSTERBOARD 11X14 WHITE 25-PK	152	5	PK	858286	ROYAL CONSUMER PRODUCTS LLC	858286	\$ 0.54
POSTERBOARD 22X28 WHITE 25-PK	79	25	CT	891860	SP RICHARDS	PAC104159	\$ 9.76
TRIFOLD PRESENTATION BOARD 14" X 22"	135	1	EA	166224	ROYAL CONSUMER PRODUCTS LLC	72720	\$ 1.66
TRIFOLD PRESENTATION BOARD 36" X 48"	341	1	EA	434415	ROYAL CONSUMER PRODUCTS LLC	434415	\$ 1.98

RULED PAPER/COOMPISITION/SKETCH BOOKS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 3.25X4.5 50 SHEET 3-PK	166	4	PK	323629	NAVNEET EDUCATION LIMITED	CB-OP-3629	\$ 0.60
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 8.5X7 WIDE RULED 20 SHEET	168	1	EA	342444	OFFICE DEPOT	MNT-012	\$ 0.22
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 8.5X7 WIDE RULED 24 SHEET	177			NO BID			
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 8.5X7 WIDE RULED 40 SHEET	732	1	EA	1394515	OFFICE DEPOT	400-003-261	\$ 0.34
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 8.5X7 WIDE RULED 48 SHEET	179	1	EA	677689	SP RICHARDS	ROA77308	\$ 0.61
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 9.75X7.5 COLLEGE RULED 100 SHEET		1	EA	998584	OFFICE DEPOT	OD756067	\$ 0.48
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 9.75X7.5 PRIMARY RULED 100 SHEET	560	1	EA	837905	OFFICE DEPOT	76041-12	\$ 0.70
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 9.75X7.5 QUAD RULED 100 SHEET	535	1	EA	900178	ACCO BRANDS CORP	9544	\$ 3.41
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 9.75X7.5 STORY/WIDE RULED 100 SHEET P/	923	1	EA	998584	OFFICE DEPOT	OD756067	\$ 0.48
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 9.75X7.5 UNRULED 100 SHEET	130	1	EA	323692	OFFICE DEPOT	OD756062	\$ 0.69
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 9.75X7.5 WIDE RULED 100 SHEET	3913	1	EA	588268	OFFICE DEPOT	OD756064	\$ 0.46
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 9.75X7.5 WIDE RULED 100 SHEET 6-PK	374	3	PK	725163	OFFICE DEPOT	HPS-725163	\$ 2.07
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 9.75X7.5 WIDE RULED 48 SHEET	832	1	EA	588268	OFFICE DEPOT	OD756064	\$ 0.46
PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 9.75X7.5 WIDE RULED 60 SHEET	1109	1	EA	677675	ROARING SPRING PAPER PRODUCT	77222	\$ 1.04

PAPER COMPOSITION BOOK 9.75X7.5 WIDE RULED 80 SHEET	814	1	EA	1228582	OFFICE DEPOT	400-003-259	\$ 0.45
PAPER FILLER 8.5X11 COLLEGE RULED 3-HOLE PUNCHED 200 SHEET	1175	150	PK	956112	PACON CORP	MMK092570D-11980	\$ 0.62
PAPER FILLER,8X10.5 WIDE RULED 3-HOLE PUNCHED 200 SHEET	2576	150	PK	589483	PACON CORP	MMK092500D-11980	\$ 0.59
PAPER GRAPH 8.5X11 REAM	294	500	PK	338012	OFFICE DEPOT	OD99770	\$ 2.21
PAPER JOURNAL 8 1/2 X 11	482	6	PK	864614	OFFICE DEPOT	99446	\$ 4.06
PAPER LEGAL PAD 5X8 50 SHEET 12-PK	79	12	DZ	306902	OFFICE DEPOT	99422	\$ 2.19
PAPER LEGAL PAD 8.5X11.75 50 SHEET 12-PK	128	12	DZ	305466	OFFICE DEPOT	99401	\$ 4.24
PAPER NOTEBOOK SPIRAL BOUND 8X10.5 WIDE RULED 70 SHEET	2408	6	PK	293799	OFFICE DEPOT	OD293799	\$ 2.39
PAPER NOTEBOOK SPIRAL BOUND 8X10.5 WIDE RULED 80 SHEET	230	1	EA	1394758	OFFICE DEPOT	SP0382299	\$ 0.61
PAPER NOTEBOOK TAPE BOUND 8"X10.5' WIDE RULED 50SHEET	320	1	EA	588367	OFFICE DEPOT	PD0473756	\$ 0.56
PAPER SKETCH BOOK 8.5X11 WHITE 50/SHT/SPIRL	372	100	PD	309692	PACON CORP	195110-11980	\$ 1.74
PAPER SKETCH BOOK ARTIST 80LB 100 SHT 11X14	300	1	EA	453367	ARTISAN NETWORK SERVICES INC	96472-PK3	\$ 18.71
PAPER SKETCH DIARY 8.5X11 WHT 100/SHT/SPRL	298	100	PD	309692	PACON CORP	195110-11980	\$ 1.74
PAPER STENO NOTEBOOK GREGG/RULED	193	12	DZ	307389	OFFICE DEPOT	99470	\$ 4.38

RULERS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE
METERSTICK	186			NO BID			
PROTRACTOR 6" CLR PLASTIC EACH	852	1	EA	713585	OFFICE DEPOT	BFPT	\$ 0.25
PROTRACTOR 6"CLR PLASTIC 12-PK	297	1	EA	713585	OFFICE DEPOT	BFPT	\$ 0.25
PROTRACTOR FISKARS SWING ARM	171	1	EA	166607	STAEDTLER MARS LTD	56854-15BK	\$ 0.78
RULER DOUBLE BEVELED 12"	227	1	EA	1378702	OFFICE DEPOT	OM99440	\$ 0.06
RULER FLEXIBLE 12"	894	1	EA	724594	OFFICE DEPOT	20121206-3	\$ 0.91
RULER PLASTIC 12" ASSORTED COLORS 6-PK	304	1	EA	720461	OFFICE DEPOT	RTP-003608-OP-087-05	\$ 0.23
RULER PLASTIC CLEAR 12" 10-PK	201	1	EA	720461	OFFICE DEPOT	RTP-003608-OP-087-05	\$ 0.23
RULER WOOD BRASS END 12"	103	1	EA	1378702	OFFICE DEPOT	OM99440	\$ 0.06
RULER WOOD ENGLISH/METRIC 12" NATURAL	105	1	EA	1378702	OFFICE DEPOT	OM99440	\$ 0.06
RULER WOOD SINGLE BEVELED 12"	138	1	EA	998013	ACME UNITED CORP	10381	\$ 0.78
YARDSTICK	119	1	EA	502325	OFFICE DEPOT	NB20110508	\$ 2.68

SENTENCE STRIPS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
DRY-ERASE SENTENCE STRIP 3X34 PK-30	62	30	PK	388374	SP RICHARDS	PAC5185	\$ 2.96	
PAPER SENTENCE STRIP 3X24 ASST PK-100	360	100	PK	898512	PACON CORP	1733	\$ 4.46	
PAPER SENTENCE STRIP 3X24 WHITE PK-100	491	100	PK	394012	PACON CORP	5166	\$ 1.68	

SCISSORS	QUANTITY PURCHASED LAST YEAR	QTY/SIZE PACKAGED	UOM BID	VENDOR ITEM NUMBER	MANUFACTURER NAME	MANUFACTURER ITEM NUMBER	PRICE	INDICATE ADDITIONAL COLORS AVAILABLE AT THE SAME PRICE
SCISSORS 5" BLUNT FISKARS 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	182	12	PK	327610	SP RICHARDS	FSK95017197J	\$ 18.62	
SCISSORS 5" BLUNT WITH RACK FISKARS 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	121	12	PK	164249	SP RICHARDS	ACM15971	\$ 15.62	
SCISSORS 5" POINTED FISKARS 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	99	12	PK	327628	FISKARS INC	95037097	\$ 18.36	
SCISSORS 5" POINTED WITH RACK FISKARS 12-PK OR EQUIVALENT	57	12	PK	487146	SP RICHARDS	ACM15972	\$ 15.62	
SCISSORS 5" BLUNT FISKARS LEFT HANDED OR EUIVALENT	54	1	EA	972029	OFFICE DEPOT	24015	\$ 0.23	
SCISSORS 5" BLUNT FISKARS OR EUIVALENT	586	1	EA	972029	OFFICE DEPOT	24015	\$ 0.23	
SCISSORS 5" POINTED FISKARS OR EQUIVALENT	535	1	EA	971939	OFFICE DEPOT	24016	\$ 0.23	
SCISSORS 6" POINTED 12-PK	67	12	PK	327628	FISKARS INC	95037097	\$ 18.36	

SCISSORS 6"POINTED FISKARS OR EQUIVALENT	199	1	EA	971939	OFFICE DEPOT	24016	\$	0.23
SCISSORS 7" STAINLESS STEEL STRAIGHT	597	1	EA	375667	OFFICE DEPOT	30029	\$	0.92
SCISSORS 8" STAINLESS STEEL STRAIGHT	1378	1	EA	375667	OFFICE DEPOT	30029	\$	0.92
SCISSORS 8" LOOP	127	1	EA	375667	OFFICE DEPOT	30029	\$	0.92